The Fleming County Fiscal Court held the regular monthly meeting on Tuesday, October 14,
2025 at the Fleming County Courthouse, 100 Court Square, Flemingsburg, Kentucky. County
Judge/ Executive Sims called the meeting to order at 9:01 AM. Roll called by Fiscal Court Clerk
Tammy L. Gray as follows: Magistrates present: Taylor Hunt, Richie Kielman, Blake Price,
Donnie Fawns and Ray H. Money. Absent: Magistrate Kerri Marshall. Also present was County
Attorney Monica Hill and County Treasurer Miranda Utterback.

Vote Unan. Motion: Richie Kielman Second: Ray H. Money
A motion was made to approve today's meeting agenda.

Vote Unan. Motion: Blake Price Second: Richie Kielman
A motion was made to approve the meeting minutes of September 9, 2025.

The Ion Center was present for the signing of Proclamation in observance of Domestic Violence
Awareness Month.

Vote Unan. Motion: Ray H. Money Second: Richie Kielman
A motion was made to approve annual agreement for Trash for Cash program Insurance as
presented.

Vote Unan. Motion: Taylor Hunt Second: Donnie Fawns
A motion was made to approve KYTC agreement and Resolution 25-1435 pertaining to the
FY?25-26 Flex Funds for resurfacing as presented.

Vote Unan. Motion: Richie Kielman Second: Blake Price
A motion was made to approve the renewal of RCS Siren Maintenance agreement as presented.

Dispatch Director Shawn Royse came before the Court with September requests for services
report and hiring of two Part-time dispatchers and promoted one dispatcher to Full Time.

Vote Unan. Motion: Taylor Hunt Second: Richie Kielman
A motion was made to approve Resolution 25-1436 pertaining to Kinetic ABS KY LLC as
presented.

Vote Unan. Motion: Richie Kielman Second: Donnie Fawns

A motion was made to approve the month ending and quarter ending September 30, 2025
financial reports as presented: General Fund $ 520,870.04 , Road Fund $ 618,704.85,

Jail Fund $ 29,077.62, LGEA Fund $ 254,818.36 , Forest Fire Fund $ 109.25 , Opioid Fund
$ 306,648.58, Dispatch Fund $ 52,900.01, Clerk’s Storage Fund $ 18,207.13, ABC Funds

$ 57,285.35, Capital Improvement Fund $ 312,600.78 Total all funds $ 2,171,221.97.

Vote Unan. Motion: Ray H. Money Second: Taylor Hunt
A motion was made to approve Budget Transfers as presented.

Vote Unan. Motion: Donnie Fawns Second: Blake Price
A motion was made to approve Cash Transfers as presented.
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Vote Unan. Motion: Ray H. Money Second: Donnie Fawns
A motion was made to approve Claims Reports and Carry In Claims Reports as read and
presented.

Vote Unan. Motion: Richie Kielman Second : Ray H. Money
A motion was made to approve the first reading of Ordinance 14-1434 Budget Amendment as
read and presented.

Vote Unan. Motion: Donnie Fawns Second : Taylor Hunt
A motion was made to approve payment of Sheriff’s earned training incentive $ 1,325.53.

Vote Unan. Motion: Richie Kielman Second: Ray H. Money
A motion was made to approve the September 2025 County Road Maintenance Reports.

Vote Unan. Motion: Richie Kielman Second : Ray H. Money

A motion was made to approve to surplus old rusted truck bed off of the Chevy One-ton truck
and 18’ pull behind trailer ( no vin #) and sell at next available public auction with Marshall
Equipment Auctions.

Vote Unan. Motion: Richie Kielman Second: Ray H. Money
A motion was made to approve the purchase of a new truck bed estimated at $ 7,500.00 and tilt
trailer quoted just under $ 13,000.00.

Vote Unan. Motion: Taylor Hunt Second: Donnie Fawns
A motion was made to approve the September 2025 monthly Fleming County Sheriff report.

Vote Unan. Motion: Taylor Hunt Second: Donnie Fawns

A motion was made to approve the September 2025 quarter ending report of the Fleming County
Sheriff.

Vote Unan. Motion: Ray H. Money Second: Donnie Fawns

A motion was made to surplus and sell at next available public auction with Marshall Equipment
Auctions: 2009 Ford Crown Victoria VIN 2FAHP71VX9X102231 and

2010 Ford Crown Victoria VIN 2FABP7BVXAX128440.

Vote Unan. Motion: Ray H. Money Second: Blake Price
A motion was made to approve the jailer’s report.

Vote Unan. Motion Taylor Hunt Second: Richie Kielman

A motion was made to accept all sealed bids received for old office furniture and award to
highest bidder, all no bid items will be junked and authorized T. Gray to take all no bid items.
Sealed bids received:

Item # 1 Wood chair — One bid $ 10.00 T. Gray

Item # 2 Wood chair — One bid $ 26.51 A. Conley

Item # 3 Wood chair — One bid $ 5.00 T. Gray

Item # 4 Wood chair — Two bids § 10.00 B. Vice, $ 5.00 T. Gray

Item # 5 Wood chair — no bid

Item # 6 Wood chair — no bid

Item # 7 Wood chair — no bid
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Item # 8 Wood chair — Three bids $ 15.50 B. Story, $ 10.00 B. Vice, $ 5.00 T. Gray
Item # 9 Wood chair — One bid $ 5.00 T. Gray

Item # 10 Wood chair — One bid $ 5.00 T. Gray

Item # 11 Wood chair - One bid $ 10.00 T. Gray

Item # 12 Wood chair — One bid $ 10.00 T. Gray

Item # 13 Wood Desk — Two bids § 60.00 B. Vice, $ 111.00 B. Story

Item # 14 Wood chair — no bid

The November 2025 Fiscal Court meeting will be moved to Monday, November 10, 2025 at 3:00
PM due to Veterans Day holiday.

Vote Unan. Motion: Richie Kielman Second: Donnie Fawns
A motion was made to adjourn at 9:30AM.
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